
$3000.00 / Monthly - 203 - 3055 THOMAS STREET
 

Listing ID: W9017522

$3000.00 / Monthly
2 Bedrooms, 2 BathroomsSingle Family

203 - 3055 THOMAS STREET,
Mississauga, Ontario, L5M0M4

A beautiful corner suite, meticulously
maintained in the highly sought after
neighborhood of Churchill Meadows. This
suite is ideal for young professional couple
or working professional who needs a home
office! This 2 Bedrooms, 2 full Washrooms,
offers a spacious Living & living room With
a Walkout To the Balcony to let in all that
natural light, quartz counter tops in both
kitchen &bathrooms & laminate flooring
throughout. It has been freshly painted,
brand new blinds installed, HVAC/Ducts
have been professionally cleaned and entire
unit has been cleaned/sanitized ready to
welcome its new tenants. 1 Parking spot
included. **** EXTRAS **** Includes
fridge, stove/oven, hood range, dishwasher,
clothes washer & dryer and 1 underground
parking. Heat, hydro, water (+ Hot water
tank) are separate. (id:54154)
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